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THE BENEFITS

• Visually appealing streamlined design, featuring narrow stiles for more glass

• Competitive pricing, whether taking advantage of standard sizes or “made to measure”

• A product line that is designed to suit any residential or commercial application

• Thermally-broken designs and glass options for optimal energy performance

• Single lite door panels up to 39” wide and 10’ tall without horizontal mullions

• Patented Zero Step Sill technology for flush floor transitions from the interior to the exterior 

without sacrificing performance

• Top hung or floor rolling

• Screening solutions that include solar and privacy options

• Industry leading time from order to delivery

• Complete systems with installation instructions for straightforward assembly and ease of 

installation

• 3 dimensional easy adjustment access using just a screwdriver

• 10 year limited warranty across our product lines

• Over 15 years of manufacturing experience and innovation built into every LaCantina Door

• Extensive testing to meet AAMA standards

• True FSC chain of custody manufacturer

• Manufactured in the USA

ALUMINUM SYSTEM

Strikingly clean and narrow, our Aluminum system features a 2 3/4” stile and rail profile 
allowing for more glass and light.  Suitable for both residential and commercial projects, 
the Aluminum system is available in a clear or dark bronze anodized finish, and can also 
be custom color matched.  

ALUMINUM WOOD SYSTEM

Our newest design innovation, the Aluminum Wood system delivers everything you would 
want in a door system.  A low maintenance exterior with the beauty of a real, natural wood 
interior, combined with concealed multi point locks.  Featuring 2 1/4” thick panels and the 
ability to be built up to 52 feet wide and 10 feet high.

WOOD SYSTEM

The original LaCantina Door system, and still one of our most popular, natural beauty in 
its purest form.  Our all Wood system is available in your choice of Vertical grain Douglas 
Fir and Mahogany.  Ready to seal or stain, let your all wood LaCantina Doors be the 
highlight of any space.  Custom wood species can be sourced to match your design 
requirements. 

ALUMINUM THERMALLY BROKEN SYSTEM - NEW 2010

For extreme climates, LaCantina Doors has a new Aluminum system with thermal 
performance. Its sleek design with 2 1/4” thick panels and a thin 2 3/4” stile and rail, the 
new thermally broken Aluminum door is designed to suit DP55 testing and impact ratings. 
Manufactured to any design specification this door can suite large openings up to 52 feet 
wide and 10 feet high.   

CLAD SYSTEM

Featuring a custom extruded aluminum exterior and solid core construction, the Clad 
system is our wood product that withstands weather conditions with a exterior cladding 
that can be custom color matched.  One of our most popular options, the Clad system 
has a preferred 3 5/8” narrow stile and rail profile, allowing a perfect balance of light and 
glass into your space.

2008 AIA Honor Award
Central Coast Chapter, California

An extension of a family home that is almost 

square in plan.  The space flows horizontally 

from the existing kitchen into the living room, 

then up the open stairwell.

LaCantina Doors open wide to allow 

interweaving of outdoor and indoor space 

characterizing a uniquely Californian way of 

living.  There is a breezy informality that takes 

you from the highly polished concrete floors 

inside to the slightly more textured concrete 

of the patio.  Blending the indoor and outdoor 

living room with the same concrete floor surface 

extends the perceptual size of the room.
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Embrace New Space

WOOD CLAD ALUMINUM
IN STOCK WOOD SPECIES IN STOCK CLAD COLORS IN STOCK ALUMINUM COLORS

Colors and grain vary due to print - Request actual samples  •  Custom wood and color sourcing available

Vertical grain
Douglas fir

Bronze Clear anodizedMahogany White Bronze anodized White


